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ABSTRACT: Two field trials in RCB design were carried 
out in Shandaweel Experimental Station Agricultural Research 
Center (ARC). Sohag governorate (26, 34 oN) during 2000/ 
200 I and 2001/2002 seasons, to study the effect of intercrop­
ping onion in various densities (77000, 115.500 and 154000 
plants/fed., represent 50, 75 and 100 of the sole onion crop) on 
the quality and productivity of sugar beet planted in two ridge 
width i.e. 50 and 100 em (without any change in beet density). 
In the same time, economic evaluation of intercropping such as 
fanner net return (NR) and profitability was take in considera­
tion. The results revealed that; intercropping onion in various 
densities on sugar beet planted in both ridge width had insig­
nificant effect on most quality and productivity traits in both 
seasons, except pol% (in the first season), extractable sugar 
(sugar recovery), extractability % and sugar yield ton/fed. (In 
both seasons). 

The highest beet quality and productivity were obtained from 
beet planted on I 00 em ridge width and intercropped with two 
onion rows (represent 50% (77000 plant/fed) density of onion 
in pure stand in both seasons while, intercropping onion on the 
other side of beet ridge 50 em width (gave the same previous 
onion density) was high and negatively affected beet quality 
and productivity. 

Average beet bulb, yield/fed and TSS were significantly re­
duced by various intercropping patterns on both seasons as 
compared with onion in pure stand, meantime yield of onion I 
Fed increased gradually with the increase in onion density. All 
intercropping treatments are increased markedly farmer net re­
turn and profitability per unit capital input (one LE), but inter­
cropping two or three of onion (represent 50 and 75 %density 
of onion on pure stand) on the wide ridge of beet were maxi­
mized those traits. 
































