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SUMMARY 

In this study two experiments were conducted to determine the levels of 
niacin and pyridoxine which required for tilapia fish for maximum 
growth and prevention of deficiency signs. Fingerlings tilapia (average 
weight 5 gm) were fed diets supplemented with 0, 6, 12, 24 & 48 mg 
niacin/kg diet (Exp. I) and 0, 3, 6 & 12 mg pyridoxine HCI /kg diet 
(Exp.II) for I 0 weeks each. Fish fed the niacin unsupplemented diet 
exhibited anorexia, loss of gain, incoordination, skin and fin lesions and 
high mortality rate. No significant differences (P>O.OS) in weight gains, 
feed efficiency and protein utilization were observed in the fish groups 
fed on the diets containing 12 mg niacin/ kg diet or more; however, 
growth rate and feed efficiency recorded maximum values at the level 
of 12 mg niacin/kg diet. There were no significant differences (P>O.OS) 
in the growth parameters, survival and feed utilization in the fish groups 
fed on the diets containing 6 mg pyridoxine HCl or more. Fish fed on the 
diets devoid of pyridoxine HCI had anorexia, nervous manifestations, 
poor growth, ataxia and rapid breathing. It could be concluded that, 
niacin and pyridoxine are essential for growth, efficiency of feed 
utilization and survival of fish and increase protein retention and 
efficiency ratio. Tilapia fish need about 12 mg niacin/kg diet and 6 mg 
pyridoxine HCI!kg diet for optimum performance and increasing the 
level of supplementation does not have any significant benefit. 
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INTRODUCTION 

Natural feed is usually rich in vitamins, while this may not be the 
case with the formulated one. Vitamin deficiency appears, therefore 
mainly in intensive culture systems, stocked at high density of fish, 
where supplementary feed is the major, if not the only, source of feed. 
Vitamin requirements of tilapia have not been widely studied. The only 
available information on vitamin requirements, allowances established 
for other warm-water fish are used. Niacin functions as a component of 
the two coenzymes (NAD, NADP) which are essential for several 
oxidation-reductions processes in metabolism. They are also involved in 
various energy yielding and biosynthetic pathways. The conversion of 
tryptophan to niacin is limited in fish and niacin must be fed to prevent 
deficiency and improve growth. Channel catfish and common carp 
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