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ABSTRACT

Fruits of Mabrouka (early-season), Mesk (mid-season), and Keitt
(late-season) Mango [Mangijera indica L.] cultivars, were harvested at
mature-green stage.· and stored at looe or 200 e and 90% RH. Storage
temperature of looe was used as a minimum safe temperature and storage
period was \·ariable. The time-temperature for incipient visible symptoms of
chilling injury development (pitting and necrosis) during or after cold
storage was investigated. Also, the use of hot water treatment (53°e for 5
min) o~ imazalil dip (150 ppm / 5 min) was examined. Fruit physical and
chemical parameters were determined initially before storage and followed
periodically at weekly intervals throughout the storage period at lOoe a:ld
200 e treatments. Weekly periods of holding at looe were followed with a
subsequent ripening at room It:l11peraiure of 200 e for three and six days
intervals. Mesk Ii-uits were more tolerant to chilling injury at lOoe than
Ii-uits of Mabrouka and Keitt. Hot water treatment alleviated chilling injury
symptoms and reduced decay. whileimazalil dip reduced fruit postharvest
decay. Results indicated that prolonged storage period and warm
temperature increased fruit weight loss and decreased fruit firmness. sse,
reducing sugars. total sugars, non-reducing sugars and carotene increased.
However, starch. acidity, vitamin e, chlorophyll a & b, total chlorophyll
and crude fiber decreased.

INTRODUCTION

The mango (Mangifera indica L.) is considered one of the choicest
Ii-uits of the world, because of its delicious taste and excellent nutritional
values. The world fruit trade is expanding but mango sales are restricted by
improper handling and inadequate transport facilities (Mitra, 1997). The
high cost of mangoes in importing countries is due primarily to airfreight
charges, but air transport does have the advantage of speed over sea
transport. Sea transport is less expensive and enables transport of larger
volumes, and thus would aid in the expansion of mango export industries.
However, sea shipment does not guarantee good quality fruit on arrival nor
sufficiently long shelf life for successful marketing. Sea transport generally
involves the use of low temperature stornge in an attempt to prolong storage
life. In practice. the minimum temperature for storage of most tropical fruits
is determined by their susceptibility to chilling injury. Many variations were


































