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ABSTRACT
The present study was designed to evaluate the black cumin seed from

chemical and nutritional properties. This work was designed also to study
the effect of adding black cumin seeds and their flour on the chemical
composition of some bakery products such as kaiser bread and bread sticks
on the nutritional and sensory evaluation of these products. The results
indicated that black cumin seed contained higher percentage of lipids,
proteins, crude fiber and carbohydrates. The seeds contained higher amounts
of minerals. The results cle~red that black cumin seed proteins contained
higher amounts of indispensable amino acids. The r<;3ults indicated also that
addition ofblack cumin seeds and their flour improved the baking quality of
kaiser bread and bread sticks. Product weight tended to increase as the
amount of seeds increased to 2%. The results indicated that, moisture loss
during baking and cooling was in opposite correlation with increasing the
added seed. The eating quality of bakeries contained black cumin seeds
were generally satisfactory with little amounts (0.5 and 1%). Using raw
black cumin seeds in kaiser bread and bread sticks gave products with better
external shape, crust character, grain texture and crumb colour. Adding of
black cumin seeds caused raising in protein content. Addition of black
cumin seeds improved the chemical and nutritional values ofkaiser bread
and bread sticks. Addition of black cumin seeds raised the amounts of
lysine, methionine and cysteine.

INTRODUCTION
Black cumin seeds widely distributed in countries bordering the

Mediterranean sea, western Asia, Middle Europe and Northern Africa. It is
cultivated in different areas of Egypt and Syria for purpose of its seeds
(Ibrahim, 1999).

Nowadays, many reports and articles have been introduced indicating
the significant role of black cumin seed oil in increasing immunity and
maintaining good health. In view of the fact, that black Gumin seeds were
used as naturai food ingredient without any known toxic effects, this may be
promising source of natural antioxidants for food use (Pomeranz and
Shellenberger, 1971; Sych et ai, 1987 and Owon, 1?98).
























