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ABSTRACT

A trial was perfonned to use the molecular markers to differentiate between ten
isolates ofRhizobium /eguminosarum biovar viceae varied in their abilities to phage
susceptibility (one isolate sensitive to lytic phage, four isolates sensitive to temper­
ate phage, four isolates lysogenic and one isolate resistant to phage). The nUCleic
acids of these isolates were extracted, purified and separately used as templa~ tor
PCR analysis using ten short oligonucleotides (OP-AOl, OP-AOS, OP-AI6, OP­
A18, OP-B02, OP-B03, OP-B04, OP-B06, OP-B08 and OP-BIO) of arbitrary
nucleotide sequences. The amplified DNA polymorphisms were electrophoresed on
1.2% agarose gel in TAE buffer. The molecular relationship between the ten
applied isolates was determined. Results of random amplified polymorphic ofDNA
(RAPD)- polymerase chain reaction (PCR) showed that, polymorphic (not common
for all isolates) as well as monomorphic (common for all isolates) fragments were
obtained for each isolate. The nwnber of amplified fragments as expected was dif­
fered with some different oligonucleotides. In some cases, the number and. si~e of
amplified fragments differed from one isolate to another for the same oligonuc:leo_
tide. In addition, unique band(s), whatever present or absent, were characteriZed for
some isolates. Statistical analysis ofRAPD-PCR polymorphisms and the phyloge­
netic tree revealed a degree of similarities ranged from 90.4 to 99.1 0/0. TherefOre
the results of this research paid an attention to encourage the use of RAPD"PCR
technique as a new sensitive and reliable molecular tool for fingerprinting the
Rhizobium strains.
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