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ABSTRACT ...

The genetic effects of two plant honnones, gibberellin
(GA3) and ethephon with the effects of two yeast strains on D.
melanogaster wild type flies were studied in four different
experiments. The doses of GA3 were 2, 5 and 10 mgll and those of
ethephon were 0.02, 0.05 and 1.0 mgll. In the first experiment,
honnone-treated yeast strains were applied to D. melanogaster flies.
In the second one, Drosophila flies were treated with honnones and
nonnal yeast strains. In the third experiment, Drosophila flies were
treated with honnones (without yeast) and in the fourth experiment,
standard Drosophila flies (free of inversions) were treated with
honnones (without yeast). Inversions In(2L)Ns, In(2L)Cy, In(2R)Ns,
In(3L)P, In(3L)M, In(3R)P, In(3R)Mo and In(3R)C were detected.
Some inversions decreased with the application ofethephon or GA3
while In(3R)Mo was not observed in the highest concentrations in
the second and third treatments where either GA3 or ethephon were
applied in the lOth generation. The fourth treatment showed that the
standard stock had the lowest thorax (24.9), and "ing (57.50)
lengths at the highest doses of GA3. Using the ethephon middle
dose, the fourth treatment also had the lowest thorax length (25.4)
and wing length (57.34) at the highest dose of ethephon. The dose
10 mgll of GA3 gave the highest lethal load (0.51±0.01) at the
second treatment in the 5th generation where M5 yeast strain was
applied. The application of ethephon highest dose in the third
treatment gave the highest lethal load (0.60±0.0I) in the 10111

generation. Plant honnones were found to be harmful to flies.
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INTRODUCTION
The environmental pollutants that may affect the life and

biology of different organisms are exceeding daily in our life. One
of these is the group of plant honnones which is widely used to
enhance the growth of many plants. Now, there is considerable














































