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ABSTRACf
1be discharge of industrial and municipal wastewater without

treatment in drains Zefta and No.5 is becoming a problem for many
fanners in EL- Mehalla EL Kobra area there waters that contains high
levels of contaminants at levels considered hazardous to' the
eeosystem.Water,soil,plant and sediment samples were collected
fromEL- MehaJla EL Kobra area to evaluate the impaa of industrial
and municipal wastewater on the ecosystem. The results showed that
heavy metals,' pH, sodium adsorption ratio (SAR), BOD and COD in
the water ofdrains Zefta and No.5 were exceeded1imits for irrigation.
The study demonstrated that the bioaccumulation coefficients of
Cynodon daclyJon growing in Zefta drain .were higher than
PhragmitestJUSlnilis and Typha domingensis.Therefore, these species
can be considered as hyperaccumulators, for :decontamination of
polluted water. This study also demonstrated that heavy metals of
irrigated soils from drains Zefta and No.5 exceeded the upper limit of
background heavy metals. The results showed that the shoot of maize
contains more Fe, Cd,MnandPb concentrations;than the rice shoot in
the 'inigat~ area with drainage water from:drains No.5 and Zefta.
Thus, the industrial and municipal wastewater in EL- Mehalla EL
Kobra area must be treated before discharge in drains (Zefta and No.5)
and remediation ofpolluted soils from heavy metals.
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INTRODUCTION
EL- Mehalla EL Kobra area is density populated and contains

83 industrial factories such as textile, fOod, oil, and other industries.
The quantity of industrial an<lrnunicipal wastewater is around 243500
m3 day"1 (107500 m3 day·1 of municipal sewage and 136000 m3 day'·
of industrial wastewater), which discharge into Zefta Drain ( flow,
354240 m3 day"l) -and No.5 Drain ( flow, 265248 m3 day"l) without
























