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Abstract: considerable decrease in both 
The genetic studies were car- area and production. While in 

ried out using diallel cross analy- 2004, its area was 252558 feddan 
sis among some new genotypes and it became 215858 feddan in 
offaba bean. All characters stud- 2007 (l4.5%).The total produc­
ied showed the existence of sig- tion was 2173151 ardab and de­
nificant genetic variation. Sig- creased to 1946924 ardab in the 
nificant G.C.A. and S.C.A. ef- same respective years (10.4%). 
fects for all characters were de- The major problem of faba bean 
tected. Assiut 11/8 is a goodgen- crop is low and unstable yield 
eral combiner for time to flower- from season to season and farm 
ing, plant height, number of till- to farm. This problem may be 
ers per plant and number of dry attributed to: a) the number of 
pods per plant. Parent 2 (Assiut cultivated cultivars is very lim­
1211) is good general combiner ited and characterized with low 
for number of seeds per pod and yield, b) cultivation in infested 
weight of dry seeds per plant. On soils with orobanche, which 
other hand parent 2 (Assiut 12/1), cause extensive damage by re­
and both hybrids PtxP4 (Assiut ducing the yield of faba bean, 
11/8 x Assiut 14/9) and P4xPS between 5 and 100% (Sauerbom 
(Assiut 14/9 x Assiut and Saxena, 1986).Over 30 years, 
15/4)produced dead plants.All F1 the general breeding research 
hybrids showed 100% podded program in Department of Horti­
plants with invisible Orobanehe, culture, Faculty of Agriculture, 
except three crosses (PtxP4, Assiut University produced many 
P1xP

S 
and P~s). new and promising faba bean 

Introduction: lines. Several studies were car-
Faba bean (Vieia/aba L.), is ried out using diallel cross tech­

an annual and winter crop that nique, combining ability, gene 
belongs to the Fabaeeae family. action and evaluation of traits in 
It is an important for human diet, these new lines. [(Waly (1982), 
which provides Egyptian con- Abdel-Aal and Waly (1982) , 
sumers with cheap and high qual- Waly and Abdel-Aal (1986) , 
ity protein. During the past sev- Waly and Abdel-Aal (1987), 
eral years, faba bean showed Zayed (1995), Nassef (2000), 
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